

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS
Bid 14-75 Nutrition Services Reprocessed Foods
Due: Monday, July 7, 2014
Time: 11:00 am

BIDDER COMPANY NAME

Item No.	Estimated Usage Thru January	Description	Manufacturer	Packaged	Performance Foodservice - Fox River			Gordon Food Service, Inc.		
					Unit Cost	Total BID Cost	Extend Total Cost Full Year	Unit Cost	Total BID Cost	Extend Total Cost Full Year
37	1000	LIGHTLY SEASONED, CHOPPED BEEF STEAK	Advanced Pierre	140/2.3 oz	\$18.23	\$18,230.00	\$36,460.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
50	339	POTATO PEARLS EXTRA RICH	Basic American	6/3.56#	\$40.40	\$13,695.60	\$27,391.20	\$33.26	\$11,275.14	\$22,550.28
39	1878	PIZZA, HAND TOSSED CHEESE WHOLE GRAIN	Big Daddy	9/16"	\$58.24	\$109,374.72	\$218,749.44	\$40.96	\$76,922.88	\$153,845.76
40	951	PIZZA, HAND TOSSED PEPPERONI WG	Big Daddy	9/16"	\$65.54	\$62,328.54	\$124,657.08	\$34.59	\$16,672.38	\$33,344.76
11	121	PEPPERJACK 120H	Bongards	4/5#	\$42.65	\$5,160.65	\$10,321.30	No bid	No bid	No bid
1	71	AMERICAN/SWISS CHEESE 160	Bongards	4/5#	\$40.97	\$2,909.15	\$5,818.30	No bid	No bid	No bid
24		CHICKEN STRIPS, FAJITA, GRILLED	Brakebush	10#	\$35.80	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$35.16		\$0.00
41	405	PIZZA, STUFFED CRUST, CHEESE, WHOLE GRAIN	Gilardi	72/4.84 oz	\$37.09	\$15,021.45	\$30,042.90	\$43.14	\$17,471.70	\$34,943.40
42	364	PIZZA, STUFFED CRUST, PEPPERONI, WHOLE GRAIN	Gilardi	72/4.87 oz	\$37.95	\$13,813.80	\$27,627.60	\$45.87	\$12,522.51	\$25,045.02
19	300	CHICKEN BREAST PATTY HOT & SPICY	Gold Kist	120/4 oz	\$56.31	\$16,893.00	\$33,786.00	\$38.63	\$9,271.20	\$18,542.40
20	327	CHICKEN DICED 1/2X1/2	Gold Kist	30#	\$85.35	\$27,909.45	\$55,818.90	\$62.89	\$15,423.77	\$30,847.54
21	103	CHICKEN FAJITA DARK MEAT	Gold Kist	30#	\$82.01	\$8,447.03	\$16,894.06	\$44.39	\$4,572.17	\$9,144.34
22	444	CHICKEN PATTY UNBREADED	Gold Kist	192/2.5	\$78.05	\$34,654.20	\$69,308.40	\$45.86	\$20,361.84	\$40,723.68
23	83	CHICKEN ROASTED COOKED	Gold Kist	30#/8pc	\$73.00	\$6,059.00	\$12,118.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
12	7	CHALUPA BEAN & CHEESE	Integrated	72/3.8 oz	\$48.07	\$336.49	\$672.98	\$37.76	\$264.32	\$528.64
13	822	QUESADILLA, CHIX BBQ INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED	Integrated	100/4.41 oz	\$73.51	\$60,425.22	\$120,850.44	\$55.99	\$46,023.78	\$92,047.56
14	238	SANDWICH, GRILLED CHEESE, WHOLE GRAIN BULK	Integrated	72/4.25 oz	\$50.51	\$12,021.38	\$24,042.76	\$31.72	\$28,484.56	\$56,969.12
15	898	SANDWICH, GRILLED CHEESE, WGB, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED	Integrated	72/4.25 oz	\$50.51	\$45,357.98	\$90,715.96	\$31.72	\$28,484.56	\$56,969.12
17	901	BURGER TRPL BF W/O WRAP	Integrated	140/2.25 oz	\$60.54	\$54,546.54	\$109,093.08	\$23.59	\$21,254.59	\$42,509.18
58	216	PRETZEL, CHEDDAR INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED	J&J	50/2.2 oz	\$19.70	\$4,255.20	\$8,510.40	\$33.37	\$7,207.92	\$14,415.84
29	860	TURKEY & GRAVY COOKED	Jennie-O	4/7#	\$70.22	\$60,389.20	\$120,778.40	\$46.11	\$39,654.60	\$79,309.20
30	9	TURKEY CAN BACON SLICED	Jennie-O	8/3.1#	\$81.92	\$737.28	\$1,474.56	\$73.44	\$2,185.57	\$4,371.14
31	881	TURKEY COMBO ITALIAN SLICED	Jennie-O	12/1#	\$39.12	\$34,464.72	\$68,929.44	\$27.15	\$23,919.15	\$47,838.30
32	482	TURKEY CHILI NO BEANS	Jennie-O	4/7#	\$58.76	\$28,322.32	\$56,644.64	\$34.59	\$16,672.38	\$33,344.76
33	892	TURKEY SLOPPY JOE COOKED	Jennie-O	4/7#	\$55.12	\$49,167.04	\$98,334.08	\$34.59	\$16,672.38	\$33,344.76
34	1091	TURKEY TACO GROUND COOKED	Jennie-O	4/7#	\$67.72	\$73,882.52	\$147,765.04	\$36.03	\$39,308.73	\$78,617.46
35		TURKEY ROAST, WH/DRK NETTED RAW	Jennie-O	4/11#	\$2.88	\$0.00	\$0.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
36	197	TURKEY BREAST, SMOKED, SLICED	Jennie-O	6/2#	\$45.40	\$8,943.80	\$17,887.60	\$34.23	\$6,743.31	\$13,486.62
18	87	BEEF MEATBALLS, USDA REDUCED SODIUM	JTM	6/5#	\$31.60	\$2,749.20	\$5,498.40	\$29.09	\$2,530.83	\$5,061.66
2	297	AMERICAN 50% REDUCED FAT	Lando Lakes	6/5#160 sl	\$83.64	\$24,841.08	\$49,682.16	\$24.89	\$7,392.33	\$14,784.66
3	30	CHEDDAR CHEESE SAUCE POUCH	Lando Lakes	6/106 oz	\$72.65	\$2,179.50	\$4,359.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
4		CHEDDAR CUP, REDUCED SODIUM	Lando Lakes	140/3 oz	\$75.51	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$51.03	\$0.00	\$0.00
5	240	CHEDDAR MILD SHREDDED	Lando Lakes	4/5#	\$63.61	\$15,266.40	\$30,532.80	\$27.86	\$6,686.40	\$13,372.80
6	56	JALAPENO CHEESE SAUCE, REDUCED SODIUM	Lando Lakes	6/106 oz	\$73.95	\$4,141.20	\$8,282.40	No bid	No bid	No bid
7	20	JALAPENO CHEESE SAUCE, REDUCED SODIUM	Lando Lakes	140/3 oz	\$75.51	\$1,510.00	\$3,020.00	\$52.87	\$1,057.40	\$2,114.80
8	91	MOZZARELLA CHEESE, SHREDDED	Lando Lakes	4/5#	\$63.06	\$5,738.46	\$11,476.92	\$16.59	\$1,509.69	\$3,019.38
10	229	MOZZARELLA STRING CHEESE, LIGHT	Lando Lakes	168/1 oz	\$40.98	\$9,384.42	\$18,768.84	\$13.80	\$3,160.20	\$6,320.40

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS
Bid 14-75 Nutrition Services Reprocessed Foods
Due: Monday, July 7, 2014
Time: 11:00 am

BIDDER COMPANY NAME

Item No.	Estimated Usage Thru January	Description	Manufacturer	Packaged	Performance Foodservice - Fox River			Gordon Food Service, Inc.		
					Unit Cost	Total BID Cost	Extend Total Cost Full Year	Unit Cost	Total BID Cost	Extend Total Cost Full Year
16	1220	MACARONI & CHEESE, WHOLE GRAIN	Lando Lakes	6/5#	\$63.20	\$77,104.00	\$154,208.00	\$45.50	\$55,510.00	\$111,020.00
51	87	BURRITO, EGG CHEESE WHOLE GRAIN, TORTILLA	Los Cabos	72/3.25 oz	\$33.93	\$2,951.91	\$5,903.82	No bid	No bid	No bid
52	71	BURRITO, EGG, CHEESE TURKEY, WHOLE GRAIN	Los Cabos	72/3.25 oz	\$33.52	\$2,379.92	\$4,759.84	\$36.23	\$2,572.33	\$5,144.66
53	200	BURRITO, BEAN CHEESE, WHOLE GRAIN, BULK	Los Cabos	48/5.2 oz	\$27.60	\$5,520.00	\$11,040.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
55	151	ENCHILADA, MONTEREY JACK REDUCED FAT	Los Cabos	144/1.47 oz	\$43.69	\$6,597.19	\$13,194.38	No bid	No bid	No bid
45	1690	DELI ROASTERS POTATO	McCain	6/5#	\$24.01	\$40,575.21	\$81,150.42	\$21.85	\$69,237.19	\$138,474.38
46	169	POTATO, FRY, THIN	McCain	6/5#	\$19.61	\$3,313.92	\$6,627.84	\$13.04	\$2,754.70	\$5,509.40
47	169	POTATO STICKS, RED, SODIUM, SEASONED	McCain	6/5#	\$24.06	\$4,065.97	\$8,131.94	\$21.05	\$4,743.27	\$9,486.54
48	1001	SWEET POTATO BITES	McCain	6/2.5#	\$18.00	\$18,018.00	\$36,036.00	\$15.49	\$15,505.49	\$31,010.98
49	1523	SWEET POTATO KRINKLE KUT FRY	McCain	6/2.5#	\$17.99	\$27,397.25	\$54,794.50	\$13.13	\$19,996.99	\$39,993.98
54	17	EGGS, HARD COOKED, DRY PACKED	Michaels	12/12 ct	\$25.05	\$425.85	\$851.70	\$24.80	\$421.60	\$843.20
56	634	FRENCH TOAST, CINNAMON GLAZED WG	Michaels	144/3.23 oz	\$54.98	\$34,857.32	\$69,714.64	\$55.35	\$35,091.90	\$70,183.80
62	576	BBQ SAUCE	Red Gold	250/1 oz	\$22.63	\$13,034.88	\$26,069.76	No bid	No bid	No bid
63	51	FANCY KETCHUP	Red Gold	6/10#	\$18.21	\$928.71	\$1,857.42	\$18.15	\$925.65	\$1,851.30
64	227	KETCHUP DISPENSER PACK	Red Gold	2/1.5 gal	\$15.69	\$4,346.13	\$8,692.26	\$14.66	\$4,060.82	\$8,121.64
65	447	KETHCHUP PACKET	Red Gold	1000/9 pm	\$14.51	\$6,485.97	\$12,971.94	\$15.70	\$7,017.90	\$14,035.80
66	763	MARINARA SAUCE	Red Gold	96/2 oz	\$21.09	\$16,091.67	\$32,183.34	\$21.46	\$16,373.98	\$32,747.96
67	100	SALSA	Red Gold	6/10 #	\$25.04	\$2,504.00	\$5,008.00	\$23.04	\$2,304.00	\$4,608.00
68	865	SALSA CUP	Red Gold	84/2.6 oz	\$24.84	\$21,486.60	\$42,973.20	\$23.77	\$20,561.05	\$41,122.10
69	145	SPAGHETTI SAUCE, ENHANCED	Red Gold	6/10#	\$23.70	\$3,436.50	\$6,873.00	\$20.37	\$2,953.65	\$5,907.30
70	25	TOMATO PASTE	Red Gold	6/10#	\$28.98	\$724.50	\$1,449.00	\$20.38	\$509.50	\$1,019.00
9	1192	MOZZARELLA STICKS WHOLE GRAIN BREAD	Richs/Seapak	8/3#	\$54.33	\$64,761.36	\$129,522.72	\$32.54	\$38,787.68	\$77,575.36
44	1000	GALAXY PIZZA 4" INDIVIDUAL	Schwann's	72 ct	\$43.30	\$43,300.00	\$86,600.00	\$40.14	\$40,140.00	\$80,280.00
60	916	SUNBUTTER GRAPE JELLY SANDWICH	Sunwise	96 ct	\$60.91	\$55,793.56	\$111,587.12	No bid	No bid	No bid
61	94	SUNBUTTER CREAMY SPREAD	Sunwise	2/5#	\$27.65	\$2,599.10	\$5,198.20	\$28.88	\$2,714.72	\$5,429.44
43	1000	PIZZA BAGEL, CHEESE, WHOLE GRAIN	Tasty Brands	384 ct	\$66.25	\$66,250.00	\$132,500.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
57	1000	LASAGNE CHEESE ROLL, WHOLE GRAIN	Tasty Brands	110/4.3 oz	\$68.85	\$68,850.00	\$137,700.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
59	113	RAVIOLI, WHOLE GRAIN, JUMBO CHEESE	Tasty Brands	324 ct	\$58.95	\$6,661.80	\$13,323.60	\$56.10	\$6,339.30	\$12,678.60
38	138	PIZZA, BREAKFAST, TURKEY SAUSAGE/CHEESE	Tonys	128ct	\$43.35	\$5,982.30	\$11,964.60	\$36.57	\$5,046.66	\$10,093.32
25	116	CHICKEN, BREAST THIGH DRUM	Tyson	30# 96ct	\$68.34	\$7,927.44	\$15,854.88	No bid	No bid	No bid
26	321	CHICKEN DRUMSTICKS GLAZED	Tyson	21#	\$54.26	\$17,417.46	\$34,834.92	\$54.83	\$12,469.94	\$24,939.88
27	1044	CHICKEN TENDERLOIN BRD, COOKED	Tyson	30#/244 pc	\$90.66	\$94,649.04	\$189,298.08	\$56.67	\$59,163.48	\$118,326.96
28	293	CHICKEN TENDER WG SPICY "WINGS"	Tyson	246 pc/82 sv	\$87.46	\$25,625.78	\$51,251.56	\$38.17	\$6,113.82	\$12,227.64
TOTAL BID						\$1,585,219.88	\$3,170,439.76		\$915,021.91	\$1,830,043.82
TOTAL BID AMOUNTS AWARDED						\$2,234,607.02	\$802,784.10		\$915,021.91	\$1,431,822.92

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS
Bid 14-75 Nutrition Services Reprocessed Foods
Due: Monday, July 7, 2014
Time: 11:00 am

Manufacturer	Performance Foodservice - Fox River		Gordon Food Service, Inc.	
	Total BID Cost	Extend Total Cost Full Year	Total BID Cost	Extend Total Cost Full Year
Advanced Pierre	\$18,230.00	\$36,460.00	No bid	No bid
Basic American	\$13,695.60	\$27,391.20	\$11,275.14	\$22,550.28
Big Daddy	\$171,703.26	\$343,406.52	\$93,595.26	\$187,190.52
Bongards	\$8,069.80	\$16,139.60	\$0.00	\$0.00
Brakebush	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Gilardi	\$28,835.25	\$57,670.50	\$29,994.21	\$59,988.42
Gold Kist	\$93,962.68	\$187,925.36	\$49,628.98	\$99,257.96
Integrated	\$172,687.61	\$345,375.22	\$124,511.81	\$249,023.62
J&J	\$4,255.20	\$8,510.40	\$7,207.92	\$14,415.84
Jennie-O	\$255,906.88	\$511,813.76	\$145,156.12	\$290,312.24
JTM	\$2,749.20	\$5,498.40	\$2,530.83	\$5,061.66
Lando Lakes	\$140,165.06	\$280,330.12	\$75,316.02	\$150,632.04
Los Cabos	\$17,449.02	\$34,898.04	\$2,572.33	\$5,144.66
McCain	\$93,370.35	\$186,740.70	\$112,237.64	\$224,475.28
Michaels	\$35,283.17	\$70,566.34	\$35,513.50	\$71,027.00
Red Gold	\$69,038.96	\$138,077.92	\$54,706.55	\$109,413.10
Richs/Seapak	\$64,761.36	\$129,522.72	\$38,787.68	\$77,575.36
Schwann's	\$43,300.00	\$86,600.00	\$40,140.00	\$80,280.00
Sunwise	\$58,392.66	\$116,785.32	\$2,714.72	\$5,429.44
Tasty Brands	\$141,761.80	\$283,523.60	\$6,339.30	\$12,678.60
Tonys	\$5,982.30	\$11,964.60	\$5,046.66	\$10,093.32
Tyson	\$145,619.72	\$291,239.44	\$77,747.24	\$155,494.48
TOTAL	\$1,585,219.88	\$3,170,439.76	\$915,021.91	\$1,830,043.82
TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED		\$802,784.10		\$1,431,822.92

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS
Bid 14-75 Nutrition Services Reprocessed Foods
Due: Monday, July 7, 2014
Time: 11:00 am

BIDDER COMPANY NAME

Item No.	Estimated Usage Thru January	Description	Manufacturer	Packaged	Performance Foodservice - Fox River		Extend Total Cost Full Year
					Unit Cost	Total BID Cost	
37	1000	LIGHTLY SEASONED, CHOPPED BEEF STEAK	Advanced Pierre	140/2.3 oz	\$18.23	\$18,230.00	\$36,460.00
11	121	PEPPERJACK 120H	Bongards	4/5#	\$42.65	\$5,160.65	\$10,321.30
1	71	AMERICAN/SWISS CHEESE 160	Bongards	4/5#	\$40.97	\$2,909.15	\$5,818.30
41	405	PIZZA, STUFFED CRUST, CHEESE, WHOLE GRAIN	Gilardi	72/4.84 oz	\$37.09	\$15,021.45	\$30,042.90
42	364	PIZZA, STUFFED CRUST, PEPPERONI, WHOLE GRAIN	Gilardi	72/4.87 oz	\$37.95	\$13,813.80	\$27,627.60
51	87	BURRITO, EGG CHEESE WHOLE GRAIN, TORTILLA	Los Cabos	72/3.25 oz	\$33.93	\$2,951.91	\$5,903.82
52	71	BURRITO, EGG, CHEESE TURKEY, WHOLE GRAIN	Los Cabos	72/3.25 oz	\$33.52	\$2,379.92	\$4,759.84
53	200	BURRITO, BEAN CHEESE, WHOLE GRAIN, BULK	Los Cabos	48/5.2 oz	\$27.60	\$5,520.00	\$11,040.00
55	151	ENCHILADA, MONTEREY JACK REDUCED FAT	Los Cabos	144/1.47 oz	\$43.69	\$6,597.19	\$13,194.38
45	1690	DELI ROASTERS POTATO	McCain	6/5#	\$24.01	\$40,575.21	\$81,150.42
46	169	POTATO, FRY, THIN	McCain	6/5#	\$19.61	\$3,313.92	\$6,627.84
47	169	POTATO STICKS, RED, SODIUM, SEASONED	McCain	6/5#	\$24.06	\$4,065.97	\$8,131.94
48	1001	SWEET POTATO BITES	McCain	6/2.5#	\$18.00	\$18,018.00	\$36,036.00
49	1523	SWEET POTATO KRINKLE KUT FRY	McCain	6/2.5#	\$17.99	\$27,397.25	\$54,794.50
54	17	EGGS, HARD COOKED, DRY PACKED	Michaels	12/12 ct	\$25.05	\$425.85	\$851.70
56	634	FRENCH TOAST, CINNAMON GLAZED WG	Michaels	144/3.23 oz	\$54.98	\$34,857.32	\$69,714.64
60	916	SUNBUTTER GRAPE JELLY SANDWICH	Sunwise	96 ct	\$60.91	\$55,793.56	\$111,587.12
61	94	SUNBUTTER CREAMY SPREAD	Sunwise	2/5#	\$27.65	\$2,599.10	\$5,198.20
43	1000	PIZZA BAGEL, CHEESE, WHOLE GRAIN	Tasty Brands	384 ct	\$66.25	\$66,250.00	\$132,500.00
57	1000	LASAGNE CHEESE ROLL, WHOLE GRAIN	Tasty Brands	110/4.3 oz	\$68.85	\$68,850.00	\$137,700.00
59	113	RAVIOLI, WHOLE GRAIN, JUMBO CHEESE	Tasty Brands	324 ct	\$58.95	\$6,661.80	\$13,323.60
		TOTAL BID AMOUNTS AWARDED				\$401,392.05	\$802,784.10

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS
Bid 14-75 Nutrition Services Reprocessed Foods
Due: Monday, July 7, 2014
Time: 11:00 am

BIDDER COMPANY NAME

Gordon Food Service, Inc.

Item No.	Estimated Usage Thru January	Description	Manufacturer	Packaged	Unit Cost	Total BID Cost	Extend Total Cost Full Year
50	339	POTATO PEARLS EXTRA RICH	Basic American	6/3.56#	\$33.26	\$11,275.14	\$22,550.28
39	1878	PIZZA, HAND TOSSED CHEESE WHOLE GRAIN	Big Daddy	9/16"	\$40.96	\$76,922.88	\$153,845.76
40	951	PIZZA, HAND TOSSED PEPPERONI WG	Big Daddy	9/16"	\$34.59	\$16,672.38	\$33,344.76
19	300	CHICKEN BREAST PATTY HOT & SPICY	Gold Kist	120/4 oz	\$38.63	\$9,271.20	\$18,542.40
20	327	CHICKEN DICED 1/2X1/2	Gold Kist	30#	\$62.89	\$15,423.77	\$30,847.54
21	103	CHICKEN FAJITA DARK MEAT	Gold Kist	30#	\$44.39	\$4,572.17	\$9,144.34
22	444	CHICKEN PATTY UNBREADED	Gold Kist	192/2.5	\$45.86	\$20,361.84	\$40,723.68
12	7	CHALUPA BEAN & CHEESE	Integrated	72/3.8 oz	\$37.76	\$264.32	\$528.64
13	822	QUESADILLA, CHIX BBQ INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED	Integrated	100/4.41 oz	\$55.99	\$46,023.78	\$92,047.56
14	238	SANDWICH, GRILLED CHEESE, WHOLE GRAIN BULK	Integrated	72/4.25 oz	\$31.72	\$28,484.56	\$56,969.12
15	898	SANDWICH, GRILLED CHEESE, WGB, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED	Integrated	72/4.25 oz	\$31.72	\$28,484.56	\$56,969.12
17	901	BURGER TRPL BF W/O WRAP	Integrated	140/2.25 oz	\$23.59	\$21,254.59	\$42,509.18
29	860	TURKEY & GRAVY COOKED	Jennie-O	4/7#	\$46.11	\$39,654.60	\$79,309.20
30	9	TURKEY CAN BACON SLICED	Jennie-O	8/3.1#	\$73.44	\$2,185.57	\$4,371.14
31	881	TURKEY COMBO ITALIAN SLICED	Jennie-O	12/1#	\$27.15	\$23,919.15	\$47,838.30
32	482	TURKEY CHILI NO BEANS	Jennie-O	4/7#	\$34.59	\$16,672.38	\$33,344.76
33	892	TURKEY SLOPPY JOE COOKED	Jennie-O	4/7#	\$34.59	\$16,672.38	\$33,344.76
34	1091	TURKEY TACO GROUND COOKED	Jennie-O	4/7#	\$36.03	\$39,308.73	\$78,617.46
36	197	TURKEY BREAST, SMOKED, SLICED	Jennie-O	6/2#	\$34.23	\$6,743.31	\$13,486.62
2	297	AMERICAN 50% REDUCED FAT	Lando Lakes	6/5#160 sl	\$24.89	\$7,392.33	\$14,784.66
5	240	CHEDDAR MILD SHREDDED	Lando Lakes	4/5#	\$27.86	\$6,686.40	\$13,372.80
7	20	JALAPENO CHEESE SAUCE, REDUCED SODIUM	Lando Lakes	140/3 oz	\$52.87	\$1,057.40	\$2,114.80
8	91	MOZZARELLA CHEESE, SHREDDED	Lando Lakes	4/5#	\$16.59	\$1,509.69	\$3,019.38
10	229	MOZZARELLA STRING CHEESE, LIGHT	Lando Lakes	168/1 oz	\$13.80	\$3,160.20	\$6,320.40
16	1220	MACARONI & CHEESE, WHOLE GRAIN	Lando Lakes	6/5#	\$45.50	\$55,510.00	\$111,020.00
63	51	FANCY KETCHUP	Red Gold	6/10#	\$18.15	\$925.65	\$1,851.30

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS
Bid 14-75 Nutrition Services Reprocessed Foods
Due: Monday, July 7, 2014
Time: 11:00 am

BIDDER COMPANY NAME

Gordon Food Service, Inc.

Item No.	Estimated Usage Thru January	Description	Manufacturer	Packaged	Unit Cost	Total BID Cost	Extend Total Cost Full Year
64	227	KETCHUP DISPENSER PACK	Red Gold	2/1.5 gal	\$14.66	\$4,060.82	\$8,121.64
65	447	KETHCHUP PACKET	Red Gold	1000/9 pm	\$15.70	\$7,017.90	\$14,035.80
66	763	MARINARA SAUCE	Red Gold	96/2 oz	\$21.46	\$16,373.98	\$32,747.96
67	100	SALSA	Red Gold	6/10 #	\$23.04	\$2,304.00	\$4,608.00
68	865	SALSA CUP	Red Gold	84/2.6 oz	\$23.77	\$20,561.05	\$41,122.10
69	145	SPAGHETTI SAUCE, ENHANCED	Red Gold	6/10#	\$20.37	\$2,953.65	\$5,907.30
70	25	TOMATO PASTE	Red Gold	6/10#	\$20.38	\$509.50	\$1,019.00
9	1192	MOZZARELLA STICKS WHOLE GRAIN BREAD	Richs/Seapak	8/3#	\$32.54	\$38,787.68	\$77,575.36
44	1000	GALAXY PIZZA 4" INDIVIDUAL	Schwann's	72 ct	\$40.14	\$40,140.00	\$80,280.00
38	138	PIZZA, BREAKFAST, TURKEY SAUSAGE/CHEESE	Tonys	128ct	\$36.57	\$5,046.66	\$10,093.32
26	321	CHICKEN DRUMSTICKS GLAZED	Tyson	21#	\$54.83	\$12,469.94	\$24,939.88
27	1044	CHICKEN TENDERLOIN BRD, COOKED	Tyson	30#/244 pc	\$56.67	\$59,163.48	\$118,326.96
28	293	CHICKEN TENDER WG SPICY "WINGS"	Tyson	246 pc/82 sv	\$38.17	\$6,113.82	\$12,227.64
		TOTAL BID AMOUNTS AWARDED				\$715,911.46	\$1,431,822.92