

Bid 12-52 Lincoln Locker Replacement  
 Due: Wednesday May 2, 2012  
 Time: 10:30 am

Presented By: Vernon Hilton  
 Recorded By: Cindy Nelson  
 In-house Dept.: 1  
 Representatives: 1

| Vendor Name       | Site Preparation | Contractor Services | Overhead & Fees | Total Bid Price | Replace Rotten Sleepers Unit Cost | Replace Roten Sleepers Qty | Total price with alts | Attachments received | Alt A-1     | Alt A-1.1 | Alt A-2        | Alt A-3     | Alt A-4     | Alt A-5        | Atl Qty   | Addendum Rec'd | Bid Bond | Completion Date |
|-------------------|------------------|---------------------|-----------------|-----------------|-----------------------------------|----------------------------|-----------------------|----------------------|-------------|-----------|----------------|-------------|-------------|----------------|-----------|----------------|----------|-----------------|
| Carroll Seating   | \$ -             | \$ 154,329.94       | \$ 38,582.49    | \$ 192,912.42   | no bid                            | no bid                     |                       | yes                  | no bid      | \$ 145.00 | no bid         | \$ 345.00   | no bid      | no bid         | no bid    | no             | yes      | none            |
| Larson and Larson | \$ 3,873.00      | \$ 170,418.00       | \$ 19,365.00    | \$ 193,656.00   | \$ 75.00                          | 10 lineal ft               |                       | yes                  | \$ 8,145.00 | \$ 300.00 | \$ 28.75 sq ft | \$ 1,500.00 | \$ 8,245.00 | \$ 28.75       | 250 sq ft | yes            | yes      | 90 days         |
| Stenstrom         | \$ 1,000.00      | \$ 177,500.00       | \$ 20,000.00    | \$ 198,500.00   | \$ 25.00 ln ft                    | 1 lineal ft                |                       | yes                  | \$ 7,500.00 | \$ 500.00 | \$ 40.00 sq ft | \$ 2,000.00 | \$ 8,000.00 | \$ 40.00 sq ft | 20 sq ft  | yes            | yes      | 8/15/2012       |
|                   |                  |                     |                 |                 |                                   |                            |                       |                      |             |           |                |             |             |                |           |                |          |                 |
|                   |                  |                     |                 |                 |                                   |                            |                       |                      |             |           |                |             |             |                |           |                |          |                 |
|                   |                  |                     |                 |                 |                                   |                            |                       |                      |             |           |                |             |             |                |           |                |          |                 |
|                   |                  |                     |                 |                 |                                   |                            |                       |                      |             |           |                |             |             |                |           |                |          |                 |
|                   |                  |                     |                 |                 |                                   |                            |                       |                      |             |           |                |             |             |                |           |                |          |                 |
|                   |                  |                     |                 |                 |                                   |                            |                       |                      |             |           |                |             |             |                |           |                |          |                 |
|                   |                  |                     |                 |                 |                                   |                            |                       |                      |             |           |                |             |             |                |           |                |          |                 |
|                   |                  |                     |                 |                 |                                   |                            |                       |                      |             |           |                |             |             |                |           |                |          |                 |

Bid Opening Official: Vernon Hilton

Bid Recording Official: Cindy Nelson

Date 5/2/2012

Time 10:30 AM